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6:y>.€arthemost ambitious and integral
project in the burgeoning field of Cold
War history has been the Parallel History
Project on NATOand the Warsaw Pact,
directed by Mastny. This is its early cul-
mination, a massive volume containing
155documents stretching from the pact's
formation to its liquidation and covering
intemaldeliberations, the speeches oflead-
ers ma.~cin camera, assessments of NATO
capabilities, evaluations of Warsaw Pact
exercises, and much more, aU arranged

dit~g to the stages in the evolution

. ~otganization. Because the Russian
dOc\.tmt>ntsatenot yet available/the ma-
.teria1((~"nrn. the eastern European

'arChives. They tell of a forum livelier than
previously assumed, less confident of its
military capabilities, and, on the surface,
readier to presume NATOthe would-be
aggressor. Mastny's extended introductory
essay does more than survey the history;
it provides a road map to other docu-
ments not included, as well as key new
secondary sources.
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